


Submission of Complete Statement of Movable Properties held up till the Financial Year 2017-2018

1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9

Name,
Designation &
Initial  date  of
Joining  of  the
Judicial
Officers.

Name  and  age
of  the  family
members.

Details  of  the
earning members in
family such as their
name,  Profession
monthly/annual
income etc.

Details  of  movable
property  acquired/held
in each Financial Year.
(exceeding  rupees  one
month basic pay)i.e its
Value, source and year
of  purchase  with
particular  of
information,  if  any
furnished to the court. 

Details  of  A/c  in
bank,  post  office
etc.  Amount  in
balance  on/up  to
the Financial  Year
and  source  of  th
amount.

Details of PPF, FDR,
NBC or NSC, KVP,
IVP and shares, units
and other investment
etc.  Along with A/C
No.,  date  of
purchase  value  and
source  of  the
amount.

Details  of  loan,
advance  ets.
Taken  with  its
amount,  Nos.
installment, name
of  bank,
institution etc.

Annual  net
remarks income
from salary and
other sources, if
any, with details
of deductions. 

Remarks

Abhinav
Tiwari,  Civil
Judge  Junior
Division.
Faizabad.
(Joining date
17.01.2017)

1-Shri
Achchhay  lal
Tiwari(Father,
age-61)
2-  Smt.  Madhu
Tiwari(Mother
age-59)
3.Smt.  Snigdha
Tiwari.(Wife)
3-shri  Abhishek
Tiwari(Brother
age-40 )

1-Shri Achchhay lal
Tiwari  Advocate
annual  income  8
lakh  Rupes.(Self
employment/Rental/
agricultural
income.)
2-  Smt.  Madhu
Tiwari  Principal
Hanswar  degree
College  (annual
income 6 Lakh)
3.Smt.  Snigdha
Tiwari.  Self
employed  annual
income aprox 3 lakh
3.Shri  Abhishek
Tiwari  Goverment
Teacher  in  Primary
School  Ambedkar
Nagar.  Annual
income 6 Lakh.

1.One sofa set (3+2+2)
2.One double bed.
3.One lloyd split AC.
4.One Dining table.
5-Gold  Ornaments  50
gm.
6.Silver  utensils  aprox
100 gm. 
7.One hp Laptop.
8.One  Swift  Dzire  car
UP45W4005(acquired
by me as gift from wife
regarding  which
information  has  been
sent  Hon’ble  High
Court  Through  letter
no. 4632/j-6/2017 dated
24/08/2017
9.Gold  Ornament
Aprox 800 gm.
10.Silver utensils aprox
3kg.

1.SBI  A/c.no-
11044842638
Balance  As  on-
31.03.2018  Rs.
58,124/-(Salary
Account)

2.Oriental Bank of
Commerce  A/C
N0-
13682191001758
Balance  as  on-
31.03.2018  Rs.-
16,000/-

1.SBI  .FDR  N0-
31573109890  Value
as  on  17.01.2017
Rupees-93,988/-
2.SBI  .FDR  N0-
31573973476  Value
as  on  17.01.2017
Rupees-37,597/-
3.RD  in  Akbarpur
Post Office A/C N0-
31573973476
Rs.1000/-  Monthly
for  period  of  five
year  from
05.11.2014. 
4.RD  Rs.2000/-
Monthly  connected
with  my  A/C  No-
13682191001758
Oriental  Bank  of
Commerce
(Akbarpur  Branch.)

Nil Gross Income 
from salary-
Rs.8,23,206/-

Deductions.
1. Income tax 
Rs.35,200/-
2.G.I.S 2400/-
3.No N.P.S 
Deductions as 
PRAN No has 
not been 
Generated till 
31.03.2018

Net Income:-
Rs.-7,85,606/-






