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Registrar (Judicial) (Budget)

May kindly see the property statement submitted online received from Sushri Nitisha Singh,
Civil  Judge (Senior  Division),  Kasganj  regarding submission of  statement  of  movable  and
immovable properties acquired/held by her or any member of her family for the financial year
2016-18 (2016-17 & 2017-18) in the prescribed proforma respectively to this Hon’ble Court for
kind perusal and information as required by the Court.

In this connection, it is submitted that as per statements of movable and immovable properties
for  the financial  years  2016-18 (2016-17 & 2017-18)  of  the officer,  concerned,  details  of
income, deductions, savings, investment and expenditure made by her are given below.

In the financial year 2016-18 (2016-17 & 2017-18), her total income from salary encluding
allowances is Rs.8,80,942/- and total deductions/savings/investments against CPF, GIS, Income
Tax, PPF, repayment of car loan and the balance of his Saving bank A/c(s) is enhanced for
Rs.51,306/- this financial year from previous year’s balance, total of which is Rs.3,41,895/-.
Thus a sum of  Rs.5,39,047/-  was therefore available with her to meet out  the household
expenditure of her family consisting four members in both the financial years.

It is pertinent to mention here that her husband Mr. Anirudh Kumar Singh, transport work
(school van) income Rs. 3.8 lac annually. 
 

In  this  connection,  it  is  submitted  that  the  officer  has  already  submitted  her  property
statements at the time of joining which had already been processed before Hon’ble Mr. Justice
Brij Raj Singh, Administrative Judge,Kasganj on old case ID no.3397.

It is further submitted that as per policy/Court’s Circular letter, the officer has to submit her
property statements for the financial year 2016-18 (2016-17 & 2017-18) in its next financial
year i.e.,  2018-19 upto March 2019. She has submitted movable and immovable property
statements for the financial years 2016-18 (2016-17 & 2017-18) vide her application dated
13.12.2021. As such, there is delay in submitting the same from the part of the officer. For
which she has not given any reason for delay.

May, therefore, if approved, property statements for the financial years 2016-18 (2016-17 &
2017-18) of Sushri Nitisha Singh, Civil Judge (Senior Division), Kasganj be laid before Hon’ble
Mr. Justice Brij Raj Singh, Administrative Judge, Kasganj for His Lordship’s kind perusal and
orders?

Ramdatt Yadav, A.R.O.

Munmun Narang, Section Officer

Meetu Verma, Assistant Registrar

(Admin A-IV)

Hon'ble Mr. Justice Brij Raj Singh

Administrative Judge, Kasganj

 

Submitted for kind perusal & orders?

Registrar(Judicial)(Budget)
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