
Registrar (J) (Budget)

May kindly  see the  online  application  of  Sri  Prabhat  Kumar Yadav,  presently
posted  as  Addl.  District  &  Sessions  Judge,  Varanasi  regarding  issuance  of
'Identity Certificate' in his favour for obtaining Passport.

In his application, Sri Yadav has stated that he wants to  apply for passport for
which  issuance  of  'Identity  Certificate'  from  Hon'ble  Court  is  required.  Smt.
Aishwarya (Wife) and Km. Prakamya (Daughter) are dependent family members
of the officer.  He has also enclosed required details/ declaration on 'Affidavit',
which may kindly be seen as attachments. The matter was put up before Hon'ble
Administrative Judge, Varanasi Judgeship, Hon’ble Mr. Justice Pritinker Diwaker
through detailed office note dated 06.03.2020 upon which His Lordship had been
pleased to pass the following order:-

            “It appears that there are some typographical errors in Clause-F of the
affidavit  furnished  by  the  officer  concerned.Office  to  look  into  and  do  the
needful. “ As per His Lordship's order, the officer was again asked to send the
affidavit with the aforesaid amendment.

            Now, in reply the officer has again sent the affidavit by making necessary
amendment in Clause ‘F’, which can be seen as attachment. He has, therefore
requested for issuance of 'Identity Certificate' in his favour for obtaining Passport.

In this connection, it is submitted that issuance of 'No Objection Certificate' i.e.
'Identity  Certificate'  on  new  proforma  for  obtaining  Passport  is  considered  in
accordance to the G.O.1/3/98-Ka-Prasko/1999 dated 14 June 1999. Here it  is
also to submit that as per earlier reports, no vigilance/ departmental enquiry is
pending against Sri Prabhat Kumar Yadav. His request is considerable, as he has
submitted required details and papers in this connection.

Under the facts and circumstances, mentioned above, if approved, the instant
matter may be laid before Hon’ble Mr. Justice Om Prakash-VII,  Administrative
Judge, Varanasi and if His Lordship's approves, ’Identity Certificate’ be issued,
offline, in duplicate, under the signature of Registrar (Judicial) (Budget) in favour
of  Sri  Prabhat  Kumar  Yadav,  Addl.  District  &  Sessions  Judge,  Varanasi,  as
requested, for  obtaining Passport,  with the direction that  he should take prior
permission of the Court before proceeding abroad?

Archana Awasthi

Review Officer

Mohd. Arshad

Assistant Registrar

01.10.2020

Hon’ble Mr. Justice Om Prakash-VII, 

Administrative Judge, Varanasi

Submitted for kind perusal & orders

Registrar(J)(Budget)

01.10.2020
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