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I/c Joint Registrar (J) (Budget)

May kindly see the online application of Sushri Shweta Soni, Judicial Magistrate, Maharajganj
who joined service on 13.12.2019, drawing gross salary of Rs. 84,188/- & take home salary of
Rs. 71,675/- regarding information about purchase of a new Maruti Swift Dzire car, allotted
reg. no. DL 5CR 2339, intimated through application dated 31.12.2020.

Through her application, Sushri Shweta Soni has submitted information about purchase of a
new car on 27.12.2019 by giving pointwise details as per Court's C.L. no. 25/Admin (A) dated
13.07.1998, according to which the car has been purchased by her from Fair Deals Cars Pvt.
Ltd., Maruti Suzuki Dealer, 485-A, opposite Dilshad Garden Metro Station, Main G.T. Road,
Jhilmil, New Delhi for Rs. 6,28,000/- in total (copy of invoice can be seen as attachment),
source of money of which is that Rs.  1,89,000/-  is  stated to have been paid in cash, Rs.
1,29,000/- paid through cheque no. 412303 by Sri Shailendra Kumar out of his S.B. A/c, Rs.
3,00,000/- paid through RTGS/NEFT by Sri Gajendra Kumar out of his S.B. A/c & Rs. 10,000/- is
stated to have been paid as booking amount by the officer herself in cash (copy of receipt of
payments can be seen as attachment). It is pertinent to mention here that both Sri Shailendra
Kumar & Sri Gajendra Kumar are relatives of the officer & consent letter of both of them can
be seen as attachment). The dealer from whom the said car has been purchased by the officer
is neither related to her in any way nor any case is pending/decided in her court.

Under the facts & details mentioned above and as the officer has purchased the car from a
regular & reputed dealer and has submitted sufficient details about purchase and source of
money, if  approved, the matter may kindly be laid before Hon'ble Mr. Justice Ajit  Singh,
Administrative Judge, Maharajganj also nominated for “Disposal of the matters of the Judicial
Officers wherein permission/information for sale or purchase of movable/immovable property
and permission/information to accept gift under U.P. Government Servant's Conduct Rules,
1956”, for the district Maharajganj for His Lordship's kind perusal and information under rule
24(2) of U.P. Government Servant's Conduct Rules, 1956?

Munmun Narang R.O.
Mohd. Arshad A.R. (Admin A-4)

Hon'ble Mr. Justice Ajit Singh,

Administrative Judge, Maharajganj

Submitted for kind perusal & order

 

I/c Joint Registrar (Judicial) (Budget)
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