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Joint Registrar (Judicial) (Budget)

May kindly see the online application of Sri Dushyant Kumar Sharma, Additional Civil Judge
(Junior Division), Moradabad who, joined service on 18.11.2019, drawing gross salary of Rs.
84,488/- & take home salary of Rs. 76,975/- regarding information about purchase of a new Kia
Sonet  (Diesel)  car,  allotted  reg.  no.  UP25DB4555,  intimated  through  application  dtd.
21.01.2021.

Through  his  application,  Sri  Dushyant  Kumar  Sharma  has  submitted  information  about
purchase of  a new car on 09.12.2020 by giving pointwise details  as per Court's  C.L.  no.
25/Admin (A) dated 13.07.1998, according to which the car has been purchased by him from
Ambay Autocars Pvt. Ltd., 5 Kms. Rampur Road, C.B. Ganj, Bareilly who is an authorised
dealer, for Rs. 11,25,000/- (copy of invoice can be seen as attachment), source of money of
which is  that  Rs.  8,00,000/-  is  stated to  have been taken as  loan from SBI,  Moradabad,
repayable  in  60  EMIs  of  Rs.  16,031/-  (copy  of  loan  arrangement  letter  can  be  seen  as
attachment) & rest Rs. 3,25,000/- is stated to have been paid out of his own S.B. A/c no.
38940389051, SBI, Moradabad (copy of receipt & passbook can be seen as attachment). It is
pertinent to mention here that the officer has sold his old Bolero (Diesel) car (Reg. No. UP25
BE 5592) through an authorised dealer, All India Car Dealers association (Regd.) ( Membership
No. 2000) on 19.10.2020 to Mohd. Shahwaz Islam s/o Hazi Jahoor Islam R/o 786 Chawani
Ashraf Khan New Azad Puram, Bareilly. for Rs. 3,75,000/-. The Mode of payment was digital
and the entire amount of Rs. 3,75,000 was credited to his S.B. A/c No. 38940389051 in two
different installments of Rs. 3,00,000/- on 17.10.2020 and Rs. 75,000/- on 19.10.2020 (copy of
exchange document can be seen as attachment). The dealer from whom the said car has been
purchased by the officer is neither related to him in any way nor any case is pending/decided in
his court.

The  matter  was  previously  submitted  to  Hon'ble  Mr.  Justice  Pradeep  Kumar  Srivastava,
Nominated Judge,  through detailed office note dated 09.07.2021,  placed above,  and after
retirement of Hon'ble Nominated Judge, the matter has been reverted back. Thereafter, as per
order  dated  28.10.2021  of  Hon'ble  The  Chief  Justice,  such  matters  i.e.  work  relating  to
'Disposal of the matters of the Judicial Officers, wherein permission/ information for sale or
purchase of movable/ immovable property and permission/ information to accept gift under
U.P. Government Servants' Conduct Rules 1956” is assigned to Hon'ble Administrative Judge of
the district concerned, where the concerned Judicial Officer is posted. As such, the matter is
now likely to be placed before Hon'ble The Administrative Judge of the district concerned.

Under the facts & details mentioned above and as the officer has purchased the car from a
regular & reputed dealer and has submitted sufficient details about purchase and source of
money, if approved, the matter may kindly be laid before Hon'ble Mr. Justice Attau Rahman
Masoodi, Administrative Judge, Moradabad, also nominated for 'Disposal of the matters of the
Judicial Officers, wherein permission/ information for sale or purchase of movable/ immovable
property  and  permission/  information  to  accept  gift  under  U.P.  Government  Servants'
Conduct  Rules  1956”  for  the  district  Moradabad,  for  His  Lordship's  kind  perusal  and
information under Rule 24 (2) U.P. Government Servant's Conduct Rules, 1956?

Mohd. Arshad A.R.

Hon'ble Mr. Justice Attau Rahman Masoodi,

Administrative Judge, Moradabad

Submitted for kind perusal & order

 

Joint Registrar (Judicial) (Budget)
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