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Registrar (J) (Budget)
May kindly see the online application of Sri Vishwa Nath, the then ADJ, Ambedkar Nagar at
Akbarpur presently posted as Presiding Officer, Motor Accident Claims Tribunal, Sant Kabir
Nagar who joined service on 25.09.1999, drawing gross salary of Rs. 2,21,008/- & take home
salary of Rs. 1,59,608/- regarding information about purchase of a new Hyundai CRETA car,
allotted reg. no. UP32 MS1178, intimated through application dated 23.03.2022.

Through his application, Sri Vishwa Nath has submitted information about purchase of a new
car on 28.02.2022 by giving pointwise details as per Court's C.L. no. 25/Admin (A) dated
13.07.1998, according to which the car has been purchased by him from Geeta Auto Sales,
OEM-Hyundai,  Mirzapur,  Lucknow Road,  Faizabad,  Ayodhya  for  Rs.  16,25,000/-  (copy  of
invoice can be seen as attachment), source of money of which is that the total amount (i.e. Rs.
8,00,000/- through cheque no. 124191 & Rs. 8,25,000/- through cheque no. 124192) are stated
to have been paid through cheques out of his own S.B. a/c no. 11022345053 (copy of receipts,
S.B. & P.P.F. A/c can be seen as attachment).The dealer from whom the said car has been
purchased by the officer is neither related to him in any way nor any case is pending/decided in
his court.

Under the facts & details mentioned above and as the officer has purchased the car from a
regular & reputed dealer and has submitted sufficient details about purchase and source of
money, if approved, the matter may kindly be laid before Hon'ble Mr. Justice Shiv Shanker
Prasad, Administrative Judge, Sant Kabir Nagar also nominated for “Disposal of the matters of
the  Judicial  Officers  wherein  permission/information  for  sale  or  purchase  of
movable/immovable property and permission/information to accept gift under U.P. Government
Servant's Conduct Rules, 1956”, for the district Sant Kabir Nagar for His Lordship's kind
perusal and information under rule 24(2) of U.P. Government Servant's Conduct Rules, 1956?

Munmun Narang S.O.
Meetu Verma A.R.
25.05.2023

Hon’ble Mr. Justice Shiv Shanker Prasad,

Administrative Judge, Sant Kabir Nagar

Submitted for kind perusal & orders?
Registrar(Judicial)(Budget)
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