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I/c Joint Registrar (J) (Budget)

May Kindly see the online application of Sushri Pooja Suhag, Judicial Magistrate, Baghpat by
which she has requested for grant of permission for appearing in the interview of Haryana Civil
Services (Judicial Branch) Examination, 2020-21.

In her application, Sushri Pooja Suhag has stated that she has already taken permission for
appearing  in  Haryana  Judiciary  examination  whose  preliminary  exam  was  held  on  13th
November 2021 and she got selected in that examination after which she has appeared in the
mains examination of the same, held on 20th ,21st ,22nd May 2022 and the result of Mains
examination has been declared on 3rd August 2022 in which she has declared successful. She
has also stated that she has appeared in Mains examination in the anticipation of required
permission which is currently pending at the level of Hon'ble Judge and she is now being called
for interview of the same examination; scheduled on 11th September 2022 and her roll no. for
the same is 2679 She has therefore requested for grant of permission to appear in the said
interview. Thereafter, through online objection, the officer was asked to submit her interview
call letter and also Hon'ble Court's letter through which she has been granted preliminary
exam permission. In reply, the officer has uploaded the required papers, which can be seen as
attachments. She has, therefore, requested to Hon'ble Court to grant her permission to appear
in the interview of Haryana Civil Services (Judicial Branch) Examination-2020-21.

In  this  connection,  it  is  submitted  that  the  officer  has  joined  the  U.P.  Nyayik  Sewa on
18.11.2019. Earlier,  the officer had been granted permission for appearing in the Prelims
examination of Haryana Civil Services (Judicial Branch) examination 2020-21 vide order dated
20.03.2021 of Hon'ble the Administrative Judge, Baghpat. It is also pertinent to mention here
that the officer has requested for grant of permission for appearing in the Mains exam of the
same through online old case Id. 1832, upon which detailed office note has been prepared and
the same is now at the level of Hon'ble Administrative Judge, Baghpat. In the meanwhile, the
officer  has  appeared  in  the  stated  Mains  examination  in  anticipation  of  Hon'be  Court's
permission and also  passed the  same.  It  is  further  to  mention here  that  the  officer  has
requested for grant of permission for appearing in the interview of said examination but at the
level of interview/ viva voce. 'No Objection Certificate' is issued from this Hon'ble Court. Now,
It is upto the discretion of Hon'ble Court to grant her permission for appearing in the interview
of the same and also issue 'No Objection Certificate' in her favour or to pass any other order.

May, therefore, if approved, the file kindly be laid before Hon'ble Mr. Justice Mohd. Aslam,
Administrative Judge, Baghpat Judgeship for His Lordship's kind perusal & if His Lordship
approves 'No Objection Certificate' be issued, offline, in duplicate, under the signature of I/c
Joint Registrar (Judicial) Budget in favour of Sushri Pooja Suhag, Judicial Magistrate, Baghpat
for appearing in the interview of Haryana Civil Services (Judicial Branch) examination 2020-21,
as requested?

Archana Awasthi
Review Officer
Mohd. Arshad
Assistant Registrar

Hon'ble Mr. Justice Mohd. Aslam,

Administrative Judge, Baghpat

Submitted for kind perusal & order

 

Joint Registrar (Judicial) (Budget)
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