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Ld.Registrar (Judicial)(Budget)

May kindly see the online requisition dated 22.05.2023 of Sri Neeraj Singh, Civil Judge (Junior Division),
Raebareli  requesting  for  inclusion  of  LL.M.  qualification  in  his  service  records  vide  Case  Id
No.30962023. In view of the above, Sri Neeraj Singh, has furnished his duly attested scanned copies of
LL.M. Mark-sheets of two semesters (consolidated) and of the Degree Qualification, as supporting
documents for the same.

An objection dated 23.05.2023 was raised by this office to furnish attested copies of the documents & in
response, he has furnished the desired documents by attachment dated 24.05.2023

In connection with the above, it is submitted that Sri Neeraj Singh,  joined the U.P. Judicial Service on
06.07.2018,  initially  as  Additional  Civil  Judge (Junior  Division),  Jaunpur.  Further,  it  is  relevant  to
mention here that Sri Neeraj Singh, pursued his LL.M. one-year degree course from Dr. Ram Manohar
Lohia National Law University, Lucknow, in the year 2017-2018, prior to joining the Judicial Service.

In addition to the above, as evident from submitted attested copy of LL.M mark-sheets of two semesters
and the copy of Degree Qualification, Sri Neeraj Singh,  completed his one year LL.M. degree course in
the year 2018 and was subsequently awarded the LL.M. Degree from Dr. Ram Manohar Lohia National
Law University, Lucknow, on 25.07.2018, thus, the said qualification may be included in his service
records, as is prayed for. 

further, It is submitted that the Government of U.P. is the appointing authority of Judicial Officers,
therefore, the qualification of LL.M. Degree may be included in the service records of Sri Neeraj Singh,
aforesaid with the permission of Government of U.P., Lucknow. Hence, it seems proper to send the
aforesaid  online  requisition  dated  22.05.2023 of  Sri  Neeraj  Singh,   Civil  Judge  (Junior  Division),
Raebareli to the Government of U.P. in order to obtain necessary orders.

If approved, the matter may kindly be placed before the Hon’ble Mr. Samit Gopal, Administrative Judge,
Raebareli, for His Lordship’s kind perusal and order to the effect that a copy of his online requisition
along with the copy of mark-sheets (consolidated) and of the Degree qualification of LL.M. as well as
the attested copy of form of U. P. Nyayik Sewa of Sri Neeraj Singh, Civil Judge (Junior Division),
Raebareli, may be sent to the Joint Secretary, Appointment Section-4, Government of U.P. Lucknow, for
obtaining necessary order of the government of U.P. in the instant matter.

Vinod Kumar Tripathi

Section Officer

Arvind Kumar Srivastava

Deputy Registrar

Admin A-1

Hon'ble Mr. Justice Samit Gopal,

Administrative Judge, Raebareli

 

Submitted for kind perusal & orders?
Registrar(Judicial)(Budget)
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